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This authoritative resource, written by two counseling professors—one an attorney and the other an expert in
ethics—explores the most difficult ethical, legal, and professional challenges in counseling in an easy-to-
understand manner. Ideal for instructors who do not specialize in the topics presented, and for students who
are learning about the counseling profession, Ethical, Legal, and Professional Issues in Counseling includes
numerous case studies throughout not only to highlight difficult situations faced by counselors, but also to
give readers the benefit of the authors’ best thinking on how to resolve the dilemmas. The complex legal,
ethical, and professional counseling issues are analyzed and discussed in a manner that allows counselors to
resolve challenging situations as they arise in their practice. Included is practical advice on how to manage
ethical and legal issues such as using technology and social media, counseling minors and vulnerable adults,
counseling clients who may be suicidal or violent, responding to subpoenas; setting boundaries with clients,
students, and supervisees serving as gatekeepers for the counseling profession; developing a private practice,
responding to complaints, and practicing in a diversity-sensitive manner. The topics are relevant for school
counselors, clinical mental health counselors, college counselors, rehabilitation counselors, marriage and
family counselors, substance abuse counselors, and counselors who practice in other specialties. As a text it
is appropriate for undergraduate, master’s level, and doctoral level human services and counseling. The
Enhanced Pearson eText features embedded video.
 
Improve mastery and retention with the Enhanced Pearson eText*
The Enhanced Pearson eText provides a rich, interactive learning environment designed to improve student
mastery of content. The Enhanced Pearson eText is:

Engaging. The new interactive, multimedia learning features were developed by the authors and other●

subject-matter experts to deepen and enrich the learning experience.
Convenient. Enjoy instant online access from your computer or download the Pearson eText App to read●

on or offline on your iPad® and Android® tablet.*
Affordable. Experience the advantages of the Enhanced Pearson eText along with all the benefits of print●

for 40% to 50% less than a print bound book.

* The Enhanced eText features are only available in the Pearson eText format. They are not available in
third-party eTexts or downloads.
*The Pearson eText App is available on Google Play and in the App Store. It requires Android OS 3.1-4, a
7” or 10” tablet, or iPad iOS 5.0 or later.
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From reader reviews:

Theodore Rios:

The book Ethical, Legal, and Professional Issues in Counseling, Enhanced Pearson eText with Loose-Leaf
Version -- Access Card Package (5th Edition) can give more knowledge and information about everything
you want. Why then must we leave the good thing like a book Ethical, Legal, and Professional Issues in
Counseling, Enhanced Pearson eText with Loose-Leaf Version -- Access Card Package (5th Edition)? A
number of you have a different opinion about publication. But one aim that book can give many information
for us. It is absolutely proper. Right now, try to closer together with your book. Knowledge or facts that you
take for that, it is possible to give for each other; you are able to share all of these. Book Ethical, Legal, and
Professional Issues in Counseling, Enhanced Pearson eText with Loose-Leaf Version -- Access Card
Package (5th Edition) has simple shape nevertheless, you know: it has great and big function for you. You
can appear the enormous world by open and read a publication. So it is very wonderful.

Angela Thomas:

Why? Because this Ethical, Legal, and Professional Issues in Counseling, Enhanced Pearson eText with
Loose-Leaf Version -- Access Card Package (5th Edition) is an unordinary book that the inside of the
publication waiting for you to snap that but latter it will surprise you with the secret the item inside. Reading
this book beside it was fantastic author who also write the book in such remarkable way makes the content
on the inside easier to understand, entertaining means but still convey the meaning thoroughly. So , it is good
for you because of not hesitating having this any longer or you going to regret it. This excellent book will
give you a lot of advantages than the other book possess such as help improving your proficiency and your
critical thinking technique. So , still want to hesitate having that book? If I had been you I will go to the
publication store hurriedly.

David Clark:

Playing with family in a park, coming to see the water world or hanging out with close friends is thing that
usually you could have done when you have spare time, and then why you don't try matter that really
opposite from that. A single activity that make you not sense tired but still relaxing, trilling like on roller
coaster you have been ride on and with addition details. Even you love Ethical, Legal, and Professional
Issues in Counseling, Enhanced Pearson eText with Loose-Leaf Version -- Access Card Package (5th
Edition), you could enjoy both. It is excellent combination right, you still would like to miss it? What kind of
hang type is it? Oh occur its mind hangout fellas. What? Still don't get it, oh come on its referred to as
reading friends.

Siobhan Wilcox:

Do you have something that you prefer such as book? The e-book lovers usually prefer to opt for book like



comic, quick story and the biggest one is novel. Now, why not attempting Ethical, Legal, and Professional
Issues in Counseling, Enhanced Pearson eText with Loose-Leaf Version -- Access Card Package (5th
Edition) that give your satisfaction preference will be satisfied by simply reading this book. Reading routine
all over the world can be said as the method for people to know world better then how they react towards the
world. It can't be said constantly that reading addiction only for the geeky person but for all of you who
wants to be success person. So , for all you who want to start studying as your good habit, you could pick
Ethical, Legal, and Professional Issues in Counseling, Enhanced Pearson eText with Loose-Leaf Version --
Access Card Package (5th Edition) become your own starter.
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