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Poems for Teens is an anthology of fifty poems, with themes touching on children's diverse needs. These
include the need for love, independence, and nurturing by parents. Adolescence is depicted as a turbulent
period in which youngsters query about life, love, sickness, and the desire to achieve. The children in these
narratives graduate from adolescence to adulthood, needing role models among peers and adults to assist
them. At the same time, the poet, Francis Emson Dakwa, aptly describes the children's need for fun, so they
can face life with dignity and enrichment. This anthology is subdivided into five themes: Our Happiness, Our
Needs, On HIV and AIDS, Our Problems, and Our Views. In these narratives, the young people are calling
for recognition and communication with the outside world, which includes parents, siblings, and friends. But,
at the same time, they want the world to understand their teenage identity and not disturb their freedoms and
peace. Francis Emson Dakwa is a senior lecturer in special needs education at Great Zimbabwe University.
He has authored two other anthologies: Poems for the Young and Poems for Couples, and co-authored a
fourth book Reflections on Disability: An African Voice. His next book is titled Poems for Older Adults.
Publisher's website: http: //sbpra.com/FrancisEmsonDakwa
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From reader reviews:

James Drennan:

Information is provisions for people to get better life, information presently can get by anyone in
everywhere. The information can be a know-how or any news even restricted. What people must be consider
if those information which is from the former life are challenging be find than now could be taking seriously
which one is appropriate to believe or which one typically the resource are convinced. If you obtain the
unstable resource then you have it as your main information you will see huge disadvantage for you. All of
those possibilities will not happen with you if you take Poems for Teens as the daily resource information.

Carl Kile:

Spent a free a chance to be fun activity to complete! A lot of people spent their sparetime with their family,
or their very own friends. Usually they undertaking activity like watching television, gonna beach, or picnic
inside park. They actually doing same thing every week. Do you feel it? Would you like to something
different to fill your current free time/ holiday? Can be reading a book could be option to fill your free time/
holiday. The first thing that you ask may be what kinds of guide that you should read. If you want to attempt
look for book, may be the reserve untitled Poems for Teens can be good book to read. May be it is usually
best activity to you.

Elaine Harvey:

People live in this new moment of lifestyle always make an effort to and must have the spare time or they
will get large amount of stress from both day to day life and work. So , whenever we ask do people have
extra time, we will say absolutely without a doubt. People is human not really a robot. Then we request
again, what kind of activity are there when the spare time coming to you actually of course your answer may
unlimited right. Then do you ever try this one, reading ebooks. It can be your alternative inside spending
your spare time, the book you have read is usually Poems for Teens.

Thomas Schwan:

You can obtain this Poems for Teens by check out the bookstore or Mall. Only viewing or reviewing it could
to be your solve difficulty if you get difficulties for ones knowledge. Kinds of this guide are various. Not
only through written or printed but additionally can you enjoy this book by means of e-book. In the modern
era just like now, you just looking by your mobile phone and searching what your problem. Right now,
choose your personal ways to get more information about your book. It is most important to arrange yourself
to make your knowledge are still change. Let's try to choose appropriate ways for you.
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